
Year 2 ‘Monster Phonics’ Yearly Programme 

This document indicates the sequence of the annual spelling programme for Year 6. The programme is adapted to support individuals, groups and 
class cohorts. The timing of delivery therefore remains flexible ie. additional time may be spent on certain objectives, whilst others may be combined, 
as teaching is adapted to accommodate pupils’ understanding and needs. 

 Autumn 1 Autumn 2 Spring 1 Spring 2 Summer 1 Summer 2 
 

 
 
 

Phonemes 

 
dge, g (giant),  

c (circle), kn, gn,  
wr, ie, el, il, al  

 

 
y to an i, y, al 

(or), o (u), ey, w-
a,  

w-or, ti 
 

 
• Suffixes, 
• Contractions, 
• Possessive 

apostrophes  
• Review  

 
Review Autumn 

 
Review Autumn 

• Review 
Autumn 

• Homophones 
• Suffixes 
• Contractions 
• Possessive 

apostrophes 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

High 
Frequency 

Words 

great, break, steak, 
find, mind, kind, 
behind, wild, child, 
climb, old, gold, hold, 
cold, told, would, 
could, should, door, 
floor, poor, many, 
pretty, move, prove, 
improve, most, both, 
only, every, 
everybody, even, 
people, whole, 
clothes, thought 
 

busy, money, hour, 
Christmas, grass, 
pass, past, fast, last, 
bath, path, father, 
plant, half, after, 
again, sure, sugar, 
water, 
parents, beautiful, 
eye, who, Mr, Mrs 
 

find, great, kind, steak, 
mind break, behind 
may, say, way away, 
play, never ever, river, 
under better, after ild, 
child, climb, old, gold, 
hold told, cold grow, 
snow, know window, 
car, dark park, hard 
garden would, door 
floor, could poor, 
should our, found, 
round around, mouse 
shouted, good took, 
book, looks any, move 
prove, many improve, 
pretty, gone, more, 
horse, live, lived,  
pulled, want wanted 

most, both only, every 
everybody, need, feet, 
keep, queen, tree, other, 
mother, another, 
coming, even, people, 
clothes, whole, over, 
most, going, cold, told, 
love, something, 
dragon, busy, hour 
Christmas money, sea, 
tea, eat each, really, 
first, please, bird, girl, 
grass, class pass, past 
fast, last, soon, food 
room, school air, where, 
there, bath, path father, 
plant half, right, night 
use, new us, has, after, 
sure again, sugar, head, 
door, which, friends, 
different, would 
 

water, Mr. Mrs, who, 
parents, eye, gave, take, 
place, began, 
before, because, even, 
he’s, we’re, can’t, didn’t, 
couldn't, jumped, 
stopped, thought, 
laughed, magic, 
animals I've, I'll, who, 
two, where, once, 
couldn't, only, 
baby, floppy, every, 
suddenly, great, any, 
many, these, small, 
bear, boat, home, 
clothes, everyone, 
town, how, through, 
boy, again 

gone, horse, which, 
pulled, fly, why, cried, 
find, giant, narrator, 
different, pulled, great, 
break, steak, every, busy, 
many, pretty, everybody, 
people, any, money, 
grandad, morning, rabbit, 
that's, things, king, 
across, along, find, mind, 
beautiful, kind, behind, 
move, wild, child, prove, 
both, climb, improve, 
would, could, should, 
door, poor, floor, sure, 
Christmas, water, old, 
most, gold, told, who, 
sugar, cold, hold, half, 
pass, class, grass, whole, 
clothes, bath, last, fast, 
only, plant, after, again 

 


